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Sub: - List of important wild animaZdZ(

1. Mammals: -

ANNEXURE ‘A’

i_fauna found in Ladakh.

Ladakh is home to several iconic mammals, many of which are adapted to the cold, arid

climate.

Some of the notable and rare species include:

S. No. Common Name Scientific Name Local Name
1 Blue Sheep/ Bharal Pseudois nayaur nayaur Napo/ Na
2 Tibetan Antelope/ Chiru | Pantholops hodgsonii Stzos

3 Ladakh Urial Ovis vignei Shapo, Sha
4 Tibetan Argali Ovis ammon hodgsoni Nyan

5 Asiatic Ibex Capra ibex sibirica Skin

6 Tibetan Gazelle Procapra picticaudata Goa

7 Wild Yak Bos grunniens Dong

8 Tibetan Wild Ass Equus kiang kiang Kiang

9 Snow Leopard Uncia uncia Shan

10 Eurasian Lynx Lynx lynx Eeh

11 Pallas’s Cat Otocolobus manul Ribilik
12 Tibetan Wolf Canis lupus chanku Changu
13 Wild dog Cuon alpinus Phara

14 Tibetan Red Fox Vulpes vulpes Whatse
15 Himalayan Brown Bear | Ursus arctos isabellinus Denmo
16 Himalayan Stoat Mustela erminea Lakimo
17 Mountain weasel Mustela altaica Lakimo
18 Stone Marten Martes foina/ Mustela foina | Kogar

19 Eurasian Otter Lutra lutra Chusham
20 Himalayan Marmot Marmota himalayana Phia

21 Long-tailed Marmot Marmota caudata Phia

22 Silver Mountain Vole Alticola argentatus Zabra

23 Royle’s Mountain Vole | Alticola roylei Zabra

24 Cape Hare/ Brown Hare | Lepus capensis Ribong
25 Woolly Hare Lepus oiostolus Ribong
26 Plateau Pika Ochotona curzoniae Zabra

27 Ladakh Pika Ochotona ladacensis Zabra

2. Avi-fauna: -

Ladakh is an important region for migratory and resident bird species, particularly due

to its high-altitude wetlands.

Notable bird species include:

S.No. | Common Name

Scientific Name

Local Name

Bearded Vulture

1 Lammergeier/Himalayan

Gypaetus barbatus

Skiaklag,
Chargot

Tangkar,




2 Golden Eagle saetos Laknak, Gyab-lak
3 Chukar Partridge Alectoris chukar Srakpa
4 Himalayan Griffon Gyps Himalayensis | Thang-kar
5 Common Kestrel Falco tinnunculus Tha
6 Upland Buzzard Buteo hemilasius Not recorded
7 Common Hoopoe Upupa epops :Hututusay, Utu-tutse,
Pupuk-shele
8 Common Kingfisher Alcedo atthis Nya-Za
9 Bar-headed Goose Anser indicus Ngangpa, Ngang-kar
10 Ruddy Shelduck Tadorna ferruginea | Cha Muru, Maroo
11 Mallard Anas platyrhynchos | Chhupsrak Goljang
12 Northern Pintail Anas acuta Not recorded
13 Garganey Anas querquedula Not recorded
14 Red-crested Pochard Rhodonessa rufina Not recorded
15 Common Merganser Mergus merganser Chhusrak Zalmo,
Chhusrak Thago
16 Alpine Swift Tachymarptis melba | Kalakugti
17 Eurasian Eagle Owl Bubo bubo Ugpa, Uk-pa
18 Little Owl Athene noctua Ugpa/Uk-pa
19 Rock Pigeon Columba livia Phurgon
20 Snow Pigeon Columba leuconota | Bujul, Phurgon
21 Oriental Turtle Dove Streptopelia Gondil, Gondiling
orientalis
22 Black-necked Crane Grus nigricollis Cha Thung Thung,
Thung Thung Karmo
23 Common Coot Fulica atra Chanak, Hanta Chaluk
24 Tibetan Sandgrouse Syrrhaptes tibetanus | Kagaling
25 Ibis bill Ibidorhyncha Tunglakma
struthersii
26 Black-winged Stilt Himantopus Tabia
himantopus
27 Brown-headed Gull Larus Nyagar Raktse, Nyazor
brunnicephalus
28 Great-crested Grebe Podiceps cristatus Changa Rankes, Chanak
Raktse
29 Black-billed Magpie Pica pica Cha Thago, Katang Puti,
Khatang Butse
30 Eurasian Golden Oriole | Oriolus oriolus Seri Mayon
31 White-throated Dipper Cinclus cinclus Chhucha, Tumbu
Tangkar
32 Black Redstart Phoenicurus Sentik Nagpo
ochruros
33 White-winged Redstart | Phoenicurus Sentik
erythrogaster
34 Dessert Wheatear Oenanthe deserti Ichu Lugzi
35 Horned Lark Eremophila alpestris | Okpo Thakir




36 Tibetan Snowfinch Richi, Ri Ichu
adamsi

37 White Wagtail Motacilla alba Snama Thakling

38 Citrine Wagtail Motacilla citreola Starzi

39 Robin Accentor Prunella Tseldir, Bangtsil
rubeculoides

40 Common Rosefinch Carpodacus Idmar
erythrinus

41 Great Rosefinch Carpodacus rubicilla | Lama  Chipa, Ichu

Gomar

42 Red-billed Chough Pyrrhocorax Chungka Khamar
pyrrhocorax

43 Tibetan Snowcock Tetraogallus Ticok, Te-kok, Congmo

tibetanus
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THE ADMINISTRATION OF UETST\I TERRITORY OF LADAKH
LADAKH AUTONOMOUS HILL DEVELOPMENT COUNCIL, LEH

OFFICE OF THE WILDLIFE WARDEN, LEH
DEPARTMENT OF WILDLIFE PROTECTION
Dated:-24 /10/2024

Report on the Engagement of Wildlife Steward for Black Necked Crane in
Wildlife Range Changthang.

25 Nos. of Wildlife Stewards were engaged for the protection of Black Necked Cranes and
their nesting sites in the Wildlife Range Changthang for duration of 7 months i.e. from May to
November of 2024 for which Administrative Approval has been accorded under “Engagement of
Wildlife Steward for protection of Black Necked Crane of Department of Wildlife Protection Leh
CAMPA APO 2024-25" vide order no 07-RWLW of 2024, dated 05-09-2024 and each steward was
assigned different areas of the Changthang Cold Desert Wildlife Sanctuary.

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Korzok area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 4 Upto 6 Upto 4

Chicks 0 0 1

Nest with | 0 2 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 4 0 0 0

Nest without | 1 0 2 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Ankung area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2 2 2

Chicks 0 0 2 2

Nest with | 0 1 1 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs

Nest without | 1 1 1 1 1

Eggs




Following are the month wise detailed rep n Bick Necked Crane for Samad area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2

Chicks 0 0 1

Nest with | 0 .

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 2 0 0 0

Nest without | 1 1 1 1 1

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Fukche area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2 2 2 2

Chicks 0 0 0 0 0

Nest with | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0

Nest without [ 0 0 0 0 1

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Staklung and Nyoma

area :-
Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult Upto 6 6 6 6 6

Chicks 0 0 0 0 0

Nest with | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0 0

Nest without | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Kargyam Barma area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JuLy AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2 2 2

Chicks 0 0 2 2 2

Nest with | O 1 0 0 0

Eggs




No. of Eggs 0 2 0 0
Nest without | 0 0 0 0
| Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Tsogul-Tso area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2 2 2

Chicks 0 2 2 2

Nest with | 2 1 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 2 2 0 0 0

Nest without | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Ragar (Hanlay) area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2 2 2 3

Chicks 0 0 0 1

Nest with | 0 0 1 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 2 0

Nest without | O 1 1 0 1

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Jung Ldemo (Hanlay)
area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2 2 2 2

Chicks 0 0

Nest with | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0 0

Nest without | O 0 0 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Lukung area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 0 0 0 0




Chicks 0 0 0 0
Nest with | 0 0 0 0
Eggs
No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0 0
Nest without | 0 0 0 0 0
Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Chushul Tsakzung area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 4 2 2 4 4

Chicks 0 0 0 0 0

Nest with | O 0 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0 0

Nest without | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Yaya Tso Mahe area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 3

Chicks 0 1 1 1 1

Nest with | 1 1 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 2 2 0 0 0

Nest without | O 0 0 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Rongo Dibra area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2 2

Chicks 0 0 0

Nest with | O 0 1

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 2 0

Nest without | O 1 0 0 1

Eggs




Following are the month wise detailed re Necked Crane for Tagazong area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE LY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 6 4 Upto 7

Chicks 0 0 2 2 2

Nest with | 0 2 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 4 0 0 0

Nest without | 1 2 0 2 2

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Dungti Kakzung area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 4 4 4 4 3

Chicks 0 0 0 0 1

Nest with | 0 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0 0

Nest without | O 0 0 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Ralla/Tingru area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 Upto 4 Upto 3 Upto 2 2

Chicks 0 0 1 0

Nest with | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0 0

Nest without | O 0 0 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Thanglay- Buk Shado

area -

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2

Chicks 0

Nest with | O

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 2 0 0 0




Nest without | 1 0 0 1
Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Lal Phaldi (Hanlay) area

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2 2 2 2

Chicks 0 0 0 0

Nest with | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0 0

Nest without | O 0 0 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Kargyam Chibra area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2

Chicks 0 0 1 1

Nest with | 0 1 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 2 0 0 0

Nest without | O 0 1 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Jya area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 Upto 3 2 2 2

Chicks 0 0 0 0 0

Nest with | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0 0

Nest without | O 0 0 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Rongo to Loma area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2 2 2 2

Chicks 0 0 0 0




Nest with | O 0 0 0
Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0
Nest without | 0 0 0 0 0
Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Kargyam Kongma area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2

Chicks 0

Nest with | O 1

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 2 0 0 0

Nest without | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Mukleb area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 No cranes observed after the month of May as they migrated
Chicks 0 to other areas for nesting.

Nest with | 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0

Nest without | O

Eggs

Following are the month wise detailed report on Black Necked Crane for Thakung area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE JULY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 2 2 2 2 2

Chicks

Nest with | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0 0 0

Nest without | 0 0 0 0 0

Eggs




Following are the month wise detailed r

k Necked Crane for Samad Rokchan area :-

Black Necked | MAY JUNE LY AUGUST September
Crane count

Adult 4 4 Upto 4 2

Chicks 0 0 1 1

Nest with | 1 1 1 0

Eggs

No. of Eggs 0 0 0

Nest without | O 1 1

Eggs

Following is the detailed report on number of Black Necked Crane, their chicks and nests
observed during the breeding season of 2024 in the areas of Changthang Cold desert Wildlife

Sanctuary :-

BNC | Adult Chicks Nest with Eggs | No. of Eggs Nest without
Count Eggs

Total | 69 20 16 30 11

This study and project have been useful for the protection of Black Necked Cranes, their nesting
sites and their chicks from threats like Feral dogs and human disturbances. Further, it has
helped in studying the spacial distribution of Black Necked Cranes throughout the areas of
Changthang Cold Desert Wildlife Sanctuary and for documenting the total population of BNC
that visits Ladakh during their breeding season, their reproduction and survival rate of the
chicks. This observations are vital for planning any future endeavours and projects for better
protection and conservation efforts of the state bird of Ladakh.

(Photographs enclosed)
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THE ADMINISTRATION OF UNION TERRITORY OF LADAKH

TR WY R U 1w
OFFICE OF THE DISTRICT MAGISTRATE, LEH
Tel No: 01982-25201¢ i i ! Email id: dcleh-jk@nic.in
Subject:  Stop throwing of leftover food on roads and other places reachable by feral dogs.
Reference: (i) APCCF/CcwLW, UT L

adakh vide no. APCCF/UTL/FeralDogs/2024/412-15,
D._ated. 29.06.2024
(ii) CWLW/Feral-dog/2024/424-34 dated 03/07/2024

ORDER UNDER SECTION 163 (1) BNSS, 2023

Whereas, cases of feral dogs bites has gone up exponentially, thereby posing a risk to public
safety and health.

Whereas,

throwing of leftover foods on roads and other places reachable by feral dogs has
become one of the main indicators for the menace.

Whereas, Hon'ble High Court of J&K and Ladakh has issued Order vide Dated. 12.05.2023 in
WP(C)PIL No. 4/2022 on the matter.

Whereas, Hon'ble Lt. Governor, UT Ladakh has also issued several directions for controlling the
menace of feral dogs in Ladakh.

Therefore, I Ghulam Mohd, JKAS, District Magistrate, Leh in exercise of power cgnfe_rred upon
me under Section 163 (1) of Bharatiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 and keeping in view of the
Public Safety and Health, the following directions are hereby ordered:

“All Armed Forces establishments, Hotels, Homestays, Restaurants, Guest Houses in
Leh district shall strictly refrain from throwing leftover foods on the roads and other
places reachable by feral dogs.”

Any infringement of the above order shall attract penal actions under relevant rules and
stipulgted with fine by the local authorities including Police. As notice cannot be served individually,
this order is being passed ex-parte.

Given under my seal and signature on this day of 37 of July 2024

N

1(), JKAS
strate, Leh
‘%El aﬂ‘

07.2024

District Mag

Dated. 03
Copy to the:

. Pr. Chief Conservator of Forest/CWLW, UT Ladakh for Info.
> /S\ggilof guperintendent of Police, Leh fc_Jr _lnfo. and n.a.
All SDMs of Leh District for Info. and similarly necessary action
0SD to Hon'ble Lt Governor, UT Ladakh for information of HLG.,
05D to Hon'ble CEC, LAHDC, Leh for Information of HCEC,
Assistant Director, DIPR Leh to give wide publicity of the above order both In print and electronic
7 ?x%(::i'tlve Officer, Municipal Committee, Leh for Informatlon and n.a,

QUAWN
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Annexure-D

THE ADMINISTRATION OF UNION TERRITORY OF LADAKH
OFFICE OF THE DISTRICT MAGISTRATE, KARGIL LADAKH

Phone No: 01985-232216 Email;_-dckgl-ik@nic.in

Subject: Management of leftover food

Reference: (1) APCCF/CWLW, UT Ladakh vide no. APCCF/Feral-Dogs/2024/412-15,
Dated 29.06.2024
(1) MoM vide no. CWLW/Feral-dog/2024/424-34 dated 03/07/2024

ORDER

Whereas, incidences of feral dog’s bites have increased in the district posing grave danger
to public safety and health.

Whereas, improper management, irresponsible disposing of leftover food has been one of
the reason for rise in such incidences.

Whereas, consequent upon order dated 12.05.2023 of Hon’ble High Court of J&K and
Ladakh in the matter WP(c) PIL No. 4/2022, Hon'ble Lt. Governor, UT Ladakh has also
issued several directions for controlling the menace of feral dogs in Ladakh.

Therefore, it is hereby ordered that:

1. All Hotels, Homestays, Guest Houses, restaurants, and defense establishments in Kargil
District shall strictly refrain from throwing leftover foods on the roads and other places
& ensure proper disposal as per provisions governing subject.

2. Municipal Committee Kargil, Tourism Department and Rural Development, Kargil shall
take necessary steps for mass awareness among all concerned stakeholders regarding
above directions as well as management of leftover food from above entities.

3. SSP Kargil,SDMs,EO MC Kargil and BDOs shall ensure strict implementation of above
directions and act against violators as per provisions of law.

—el_

(Shrikant Balasaheb Suse) IAS
District Magistrate
Kargil

No: DMK/]C-order/2024 Dated: - 04.07.2024

Copy to the:
1. GOC-Forever in Operations Division with request to pass strict directions to

all formations in the district.

Addl. Pr. Chief Conservator of Forest /CWLW, UT Ladakh
Sr. Superintendent of Police, Kargil

Assistant Commissioner Development, Kargil

All SDMs of Kargil District

AD Tourism, Kargil

0SD to Hon'ble LT Governor, UT Ladakh

NogawN
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